
The Postcard Hotel repeats victory as Asia’s leading 
boutique hotel brand at prestigious World Travel 

Awards 2023 
Amidst the vibrant atmosphere of Ho Chi Minh City in Vietnam, The Postcard 
Hotel shone brightly during an extravagant ceremony attended by prominent 
representatives from leading hospitality and travel brands across the Asia 
Pacific region. 

The highly esteemed World Travel Awards 2023 witnessed The Postcard Hotel 
reaffirming its position as a paramount figure in the realm of luxury 
experiences, as it secured multiple prestigious accolades. Once again, The 
Postcard Hotel was crowned 'Asia's Leading Boutique Hotel Brand.' Notably, 
The Postcard on the Arabian Sea, the brand's oceanfront gem, earned the title of 
'Asia's Leading Boutique Hotel,' while The Postcard Gir Wildlife Sanctuary in 
Gujarat was honored as 'Asia's Leading Wildlife Resort.' 

Other noteworthy recognitions included 'India's Leading Boutique Hotel' for 
The Postcard Hideaway in Netravali, South Goa, 'India's Leading Design Hotel' 
for The Postcard Mandalay Hall in Kochi, and 'Bhutan's Leading Boutique 
Hotel' for The Postcard Dewa in Thimphu, Bhutan. 

"In less than five years since the inception of our brand, the recognition of so 
many of our hotels among the very best is a testament to the relentless 
dedication to excellence demonstrated by our remarkable team. We extend our 
heartfelt gratitude to our loyal guests and are deeply humbled by the numerous 
accolades received at this year's World Travel Awards. We take immense pride 
in celebrating our teams' accomplishments and their unwavering commitment to 
crafting memorable experiences for our guests through personalized care and 
exceptional service. As we continue to expand our presence in India and around 
the world, we remain steadfast in our distinctive approach to our intimate hotel 
offerings, from design and architecture to cuisine and service philosophies, all 
centered around a commitment to quality while thoughtfully selecting 
destinations to share with our valued guests," remarked Kapil Chopra, Founder 
and Chief Executive Officer of The Postcard Hotel.


